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Dear Community Supporter,  

 

We thank you for your interest in an annual community 

sponsorship for the 2023-2024  Clark County Medical 

Society Alliance (CCMSA).  

CCMSA is a unique 501(c)(3) philanthropic organization 
steadfastly dedicated to its mission of building a healthier 
Southern Nevada. Its valued members are Clark County  
physicians and physician spouses, who, in collaboration with 
our community supporters, further the organization’s purpose 
of providing education, outreach and support for programs 
and endeavors that directly improve healthcare in Southern 
Nevada.  

Your sponsorship would include recognition on our website, 
social media, a special newsletter, press releases and at the 
22nd Annual Spring Fashion Show Luncheon detailed on our 
sponsorship form. Our Luncheon will take place on 
Thursday, April 18th, 2024 at the Four Seasons Hotel at 
10:00 a.m.  

The CCMSA Annual Spring Fashion Show is one of the 
preeminent philanthropic events in Las Vegas. The luxury 
brand Balmain has graciously agreed to partner with us and 
will be curating an exciting runway show for the event. 

Our event sells out year after year to approximately 450 
attendees. This is a testament to our community’s support for 
our mission.  

Each year, the proceeds from this event benefit a charity or 
entity of choice within our community that fits our mission. 
For 2024, proceeds will benefit the Trauma Intervention 
Program (TIP) of Southern Nevada. TIP is a non-profit 
organization dedicated to ensuring that our fellow citizens 
who are emotionally traumatized in emergency situations 
receive on scene emotional and practical support.  

We invite you to be a part of our 2023-2024 CCMSA 
Fashion Show Fundraiser benefiting TIP. We ask for your 
support for this very important community health program. 
Please contact us with any questions.  

 

Kind Regards,  

Katie Baird and Elizabeth Jeser 

CCMSA Co-Presidents 

K: 409-370-7381/E: 702-561-6948 

11700 W. Charleston Blvd #117-317  

Las Vegas, NV 89135  

ccmsapresidents@gmail.com 

ccmsalv@gmail.com 
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